
Secretary of State 
Certificate and Order for Filing  

PERMANENT ADMINISTRATIVE RULES 
 

I certify that the attached copies* are true, full and correct copies of the PERMANENT Rule(s) adopted on  filing date by the 
Date prior to or same as filing date 

Oregon State Police, Office of State Fire Marshal Division 40     837 
Agency and Division            Administrative Rules Chapter Number 
 
Connie Dalke   4760 Portland Rd. NE Salem, OR  97305     503-934-8211 
Rules Coordinator    Address                 Telephone 
 
to become effective  January 1, 2012.        Rulemaking Notice was published in the October, 2011 Oregon Bulletin.** 

         Date upon filing or later              Month and Year 

RULE CAPTION 
 

Changes to amend rule with reference to mid-cycle amendments to the 2010 Oregon Fire Code 
Not more than 15 words that reasonably identifies the subject matter of the agency’s intended action.  
 

RULEMAKING ACTION 
List each rule number separately (000-000-0000) 

Secure approval of new rule numbers (Adopted or Renumbered rules) with the Administrative Rules Unit prior to filing. 
ADOPT:  
 
 
AMEND: OAR 837-040-020 
 
 
REPEAL:  
 
 
RENUMBER:  
 
AMEND & RENUMBER:  
 
Stat. Auth.: ORS 476.030 and 2011 House Bill 2078 
 
Other Auth.:  
 
Stats. Implemented: ORS  
 

RULE SUMMARY 
 
Rule changes are needed to correct any immediate life threatening situations, conflicts in the codes, update references to nationally 
recognized standards and correlate the 2010 Oregon Fire Code with the 2010 Oregon Structural Specialty Code since the adoption 
of the 2010 Oregon Fire Code. 
 
Any costs associated with these changes are necessary to the health and safety of the occupants or the public. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Authorized Signer     Printed name      Date 
*With this original, file one photocopy of certificate, one paper copy of rules listed in Rulemaking Actions, and electronic copy of 
rules. **The Oregon Bulletin is published the 1st of each month and updates rules found in the OAR Compilation. For publication 
in Bulletin, rule and notice filings must be submitted by 5:00 pm on the 15th day of the preceding month unless this deadline falls 
on a weekend or legal holiday, when filings are accepted until 5:00 pm on the preceding workday.                             ARC 930-2005 
 



DEPARTMENT OF OREGON STATE POLICE,  
OFFICE OF STATE FIRE MARSHAL 

DIVISION 40 

FIRE AND LIFE SAFETY REGULATIONS 

837-040-0020 
Amendments to the Oregon Fire Code 

 (1) The Office of State Fire Marshal may amend the Oregon Fire Code approximately midway between publications of the 
International Fire Code based on proposed code amendments submitted for consideration by interested persons.  

(2) Any time between publications of the international Fire Code, the Office of State Fire Marshal may initiate and adopt code 
amendments to the Oregon Fire Code, as circumstances merit (Referenced publications are available for review at the agency. See 
agency web site for information on where to purchase publications).  

(3) Effective April 1, 2011, the 2010 Oregon Fire Code (OFC) is amended by the Office of State Fire Marshal as follows: 

(a) Add new section 908.7, Carbon Monoxide alarms, to correlate with the change to the 2010 Oregon Structural Specialty Code.  

(b) Amend Chapter 47, National Fire Protection Association (NFPA) Standards and Underwriters Laboratories Standards, as 
follows:  

NFPA 720-09 Standard for the Installation of Carbon Monoxide (CO) Detection and Warning Equipment — 908.7.  

UL 2034-08 Standard for single and Multiple Station Carbon Monoxide Alarms, with revisions through February 20, 2009 — 
908.7.  
 
(4) Effective January 1, 2012, the 2010 Oregon Fire Code (OFC) is amended by the Office of State Fire Marshal as follows: 
 

(a) Amend Section 202, Definitions for Group R-3 Occupancy to correlate to the Oregon Structural Specialty Code, 
Section 310. 

(b) Amend Section 510.2.2 by adding the words “at the agency’s antenna port” after -100 dBm and before shall be 
received.. 

(c) Amend Section 906.1 by using language from the 2012 International Fire Code. 
(d) Amend Section 914.8.2 by adding a second exception to correlate to the Oregon Structural Specialty Codes, 

Section 412.4.5. 
(e) Amend Section 4001.1, Exception 3 by adding “and SR” occupancies. 
(f) Amend Section 4006.1 by adding “and SR” occupancies. 
(g) Amend Section 4604.17 by updating with language from 2012 International Fire Code. 
(h) Amend Chapter 47, National Fire Protection Association (NFPA) Standards, to current editions as follows: 
 

NFPA 10 to the 2010 edition. 
NFPA 13, 13R and 13D to the 2010 edition. 
NFPA 17 to the 2009 edition. 
NFPA 17A to the 2009 edition. 
NFPA 20 to the 2010 edition. 
NFPA 58 to the 2011 edition. 
NFPA 72 to the 2010 edition. 
NFPA 96 to the 2011 edition. 
NFPA 409 to the 2011 edition. 

[Publications: Publications referenced are available from the agency.]  

 
Stat. Auth: ORS 476.030 
Stats. Implemented: ORS 476.030 


	PERMANENT ADMINISTRATIVE RULES
	Stat. Auth.: ORS 476.030 and 2011 House Bill 2078
	Stats. Implemented: ORS 
	DEPARTMENT OF OREGON STATE POLICE, OFFICE OF STATE FIRE MARSHAL


